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“Jesus told them another parable: ‘The Kingdom of heaven is like a man who 
sowed good seed in his field. But while everyone was sleeping, his enemy 
came and sowed weeds among the wheat, and went away. When the wheat 
sprouted and formed heads, then the weeds also appeared. The owner’s 
servants came to him and said, ‘Sir, didn’t you sow good seed in your field? 
Where then did the weeds come from?’ ‘An enemy did this,’ he replied. The 
servants asked him, ‘Do you want us to go and pull them up?’ ‘No,’ he 
answered, ‘because while you are pulling the weeds, you may root up the 
wheat with them. Let them both grow together until the harvest. At that time I 
will tell the harvesters: First collect the weeds and tie them in bundles to be 
burned; then gather the wheat and bring it into my barn.’” --Matthew 13:24-30 
 
“Then he left the crowd and went into the house. His disciples came to him 
and said, ‘Explain to us the parable of the weeds in the field.’ He answered, 
‘The one who sowed the good seed is the Son of Man. The field is the world, 
and the good seed stands for the sons of the kingdom. The weeds are the 
sons of the evil one, and the enemy who sows them is the devil. The harvest 
is the end of the age, and the harvesters are angels. As the weeds are pulled 
up and burned in the fire, so it will be at the end of the age. The son of Man 
will send out his angels, and they will weed out of his kingdom everything 
that causes sin and all who do evil. They will throw them into the fiery 
furnace, where there will be weeping and gnashing of teeth. Then the 
righteous will shine like the sun in the kingdom of their Father. He who has 
ears, let him hear.’” --Matthew 13:36-43 
 
If this parable were made into a movie there would be three scenes: 
 
Scene 1: The _______________ of the seeds 
 
SPIRITUAL TRUTH: Jesus plants _______________  seeds (people) in the 
world, but Satan plants BAD seeds 
 
Scene 2: The _______________ of the plants 
 
SPIRITUAL TRUTH: We live in a world with bad people, but it’s not our job 
to _______________ them 
 
Scene 3: The _______________ at the harvest 
 
SPIRITUAL TRUTH: At God’s harvest, _______________ will be gathered 
to heaven, and _____________________ will be separated from God in hell 
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That’s the basic parable, but there are four personal lessons I’d like for 
us to learn from what Jesus said: 
 
1. Be _______________! We face _______________, but it will fail 
 
“And the devil, who deceived them, was thrown into the lake of burning 
sulfur, where the beast and the false prophet had been thrown. They will be 
tormented day and night for ever and ever.” --Revelation 20:10  
 
2. Be _______________! Confirm you’re not a ________________________ 
 
“Not everyone who says to me, ‘Lord, Lord,’ will enter the kingdom of 
heaven, but only he who does the will of my Father who is in heaven. Many 
will say to me on that day, ‘Lord, Lord, did we not prophesy in your name, 
and in your name drive out demons and perform many miracles?’ Then I will 
tell them plainly, ‘I never knew you. Away from me you evildoers.”--Matthew 
7:21-23 
 
3. Be _______________! _______________________ cause much harm 
 
4. Be _______________! _______________ alone will determine who  
    _________________________ 
 
“If anyone is in Christ, he is a new creation.”--2 Corinthians 5:17 
 
“every knee will bow and every tongue will confess that Jesus is Lord.”  

--Philippians 2:10-11 
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